AT Ho Eho Te0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazetie of India

EXTRAORDINARY
AT [II—JUs 4
PART III—Section 4

TR | TehriyTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 93] ¢ faoett, quaw, W 14, 2018/ WA 23, 1939
No. 93] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 14, 2018/PHALGUNA 23, 1939
% 3w AZIE
(STerTe T Q)

FfgET
79T, 3 7T, 2018

[¥F aife agray (FH=Er) Taw RAfRgumastt, 1995 # davaA)
wl. q.uur1/tadifas fafRaw/1524/2017-18.— SRR Fust (SUFTT &1 o9 3 Sidw)

srferfa=e 1970 (1970 T 5) =T &m<T 19 it ITLTT (2) F TS (TF) FIT Y& JAREAT FT TINT F2d g0 9
A AETY & a9 #ed 7 W Rod 9% F a1 wwmed 7 Y Fex S A 09 19l 7, 9% A

HETY (FHATY) Tor At aamastt 1995 | Hele #i¥ TAgRT Metorad [Ai=aq a=7ar &, 9700q :

1. (1) 7 AR % A 9Ty (FHE=TE) T (Ferae) AfF=w 2017 Fgam

(2) =7 fafF=et & s TredaT IUesy A GrewY, T LRI TSI § A9 TH1A fit qg F T
Bl

2. I ST TETY (FHARY) Ford fAfF=m, 1995 | (39 aT1= g T =faadi & &7 § #@=idq) -
s 2, ¥ 9= (v\) # IuEe (1) F 912 Feithd 37 @< SET A7, Auia-

(3T) W= 2005 F WAH [&ad AT 39 A& HAT H Tgd gU daAT=ad a7 4 21+ 92 T FHANT % 99 H, 9%
H oot &7 F e 39 ggEl & 9 FEAy g ngid, [ad aaw gts afga gor aaq, afz w1 2 o
29 3=, TTIE A, SATAATAE AT od+, g w1f Jaq9 w1 399 gl geh v o aq9, af
EIERAE

1473 GI/2018 )]



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

ig 01 @< 2005 & THTET 0 &< & TaL™ # o9 1998 F woH faaw 9v 47 39% avg Atk 30 1%
2005 & T HAT | HATHIT AT G &1 ST AT [ohelt FHAT o da e H TATT T

3. 3<% fAfaamt & foffem 3 % 3 - B (4) ®, Feferfea e i afteenftg B smom, sefa-

“(4) (%) erfergf=ra fafer & are e 31 AT 2010 &7 AT IHH TEA oo =l 9aT § 9912d 2l
(@) 37 - =T 10 F =re, Ffefera so-fEfFaat s aftatea G s, s -

(11) STr = it a7 | 29 FHrawaw 1995 & qger I T 27 ¥« 2010 TF 5 it F47 # Fad 72 2,
TR UF FHATL (A0 | HeTd sraeaaharal il 27 377 eqt &7 I F3d 2l

(12) STU &% =1 741 H 29 Frawaz 1995 & wgel & qor 37 fafar & i 27 &8« 2010 | w2t qa1i=g=
U BT U FHATLU TSI § (e saeawarali i Q2T ST rdl w1 9 Hd gl

(13) ST &k ¥ a7 & 29 frdew 1995 & qger 9 i 37 fAfY ¥ arg Fanfagw gu i gy 21 72 2,
T8 Amet | Sar F == BfRaw F adie aantate sas afae 1 99 a7 39 afaTe g9 F
THAT g, AT A 1 TR H9erd § et srasashara H1 927 ST e7at 1 I FeaT al;

(14) ST & it =7 § 29 Tordaw 1995 & Tger ¥, 317 59 Tt % arg & 7 F47 § T4 g0 geg &1 15
B, U8 grHet § S B =9 ARt % s nfRafa, sae o it dom ar 3939 afiam, dem %
gHaTY g, Tfe gas w1 TREr fAaem & RaifRa smaeasarsti & Q2 &7 |t w1 97 FdT 2

4, 3= AfFat = AR 284, yraem=t & ar, Feferaa yEar ateafea o s, st -

i ag HT R e S eyl it sy ure I § ug watsasd aaragh F #weer 29 frawe 1995
FT AT ITF 78 AT | i ¥, Ao 15 a9 T =Aaq FaT F IULT 39 qae H IS I A7 ¥ T IS0

AT T T G AqAITa, Tt § featad st o ordt & sqarad  srefia o % § onfae
29 & ghare g |"

5. 3<% fafaamt & feffeaa 36 4, -
() == () & et smaam orfaer fBro s, srata -

"q¥g 1 W< 2005 FT, AT &, FTRTIOIF FHAT F AATAT Fhel FHATY 6 daer § ST 1 04 1998 7, a7 37+
TETH, Tq 31 SFaT 2002 & Tge HATHIT gU, 30! IAqH G U g A16w9d TAHTE AT ST
FHATT % G99 § ST 1 9 1998 Fl, AT ITqH d18, HATHIT U U (dgle ST qI aTel SLHTr
FHATL T A G THIT2TY TTAHTE, ST TqTHTT I FTl SLTRTIorsh FHATL 0 99 97 F €97 TaHTe
TAT A AT FTAHTH TTH AT SHRTIOTR FHAT T 1T T TATTAETATIATE AT |




[T [[-TTE 4] R T qSTAS : STEYRIT 3

(@) == () F a1 Fetefeg g (31) arfae T Srem, sutq ;-

(1) sferRTiord FAATT F reraT Rt FH=T & o & ST 1 7 2005 F, AT IHH 978 qAT9gT
TU I TF AT A AT T8 79 TAHTE 3T SA9rHTors FHATl % g 7 7 1 75 2005 7, AT
IHF 9T% YA g0 U fAgrs Sa=sm 9 arel stershtiers FH=TT it =91 |7 ot =97 yiqars,

wmaaﬂﬂwwﬁmﬁ@mﬁ%ﬁmr&ﬁmﬁéﬁ@mam?ﬁﬂﬁméaﬂmwﬁ
T STRTIrh FHATL T TF ST T FIT THAATE LT

g 1 9 2005 F 7o faw |, 39 @ & AT SAqHTrF FHATY Aigd her df FH=m 9% aR)
IS 1 qawa? 2002 FT AT 38 a7& At 30 3 2005 FHT AT SHH Tgef HATHg gy |

(2) SereTiorsd FHATT F erar ey FH=TT F d9g § ST Favae 2007 |18 F J207 7w #1, a7
SHE F1E AT g0 SAH! UF o< AT &1 IeqTHT €097 T(AHTE ST HTFRTTh FHATS o dael |
ST AT 2007 ATE F YAW fZaw &, A7 I9h 918 FAragd gu v g aq|qu ae e
HeTRTIorR FHATL T T A7 GATTS IF ITAHTE, ST ITATTT I AT SFITHRTITR FHATL il S
AT e w97 IfAATE TAT 9 AATS ITAHE I AT SfereRTerd FHATT At UF gere 9 Gt

IeATr T 99 THATE g T |

(6) 3<% Fafaawt & faffaw 40 & su-RAfFaw (4) ¥ -

(i) g (U) ", 39-gs (IIl) F are, Fetafa yreem va g onfae fBhu ST, srgia-:

(ii)

wig 7 T AF 2005 F T fGEw 97 i ¥, BRIt 7 =6 3u-gs # qwrEt st a5k S g
TATT AT T T 9768 “GTd gL A AT & Tiaeamiod o ¢ |

(iv) 15 2005 =T AT IHF IT& HATHGT AT ARHATLAT % Gae § hael A7 goll< a9 &7 G695 &7
atd ATE, FT AT i FTHIT F ford;

(v) 1 Fa¥=IT 2007 FMAT 396 91 HATAGT IT Jd FHATRAT F TG H hael TG g 35 dT
I TAT I AT, ZIAT ATSRTIAT AT FTHR 6 o,

g () ¥, 3IT-we (i) F o=, Fuferiea e va g ot g s, srerta-

wig 7g T A7E 2005 F v fGEw 97 i ¥, QAT 7 =6 3u-gs # TwrEt st ae)i S ge e
T SR T 9057 “HTT g1 i Arfera” & yiaentug Srarmar g



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(iv) 19 2005 T IT IHF IT& HATHGT T Jd FHATAL 6 TG § hael A7 g€ 919 97 G695 TI0
wtd ATE, FAT AT 3 FTAIT & ford;

(v) 1 FE¥aT 2007 FHIAT IHF dT5 JATHGT T G FHATRAT % Fael § Fad 9T0g goATT S |
OO €U TS ATE, THT STIRTHRAT 3T TR & ford;

(i) == (&) ¥, 3u-we (i) F o=, Ao seame g onfae e ST, ata-

‘i T & 9% 2005 F T9H Gaw 92 o7 ¥, A awi % =9 S7-gT § I9Tal SEfeh &t “die gene
T =T 15 & 9rex “d golTe ai= |7 19 | giaeariod fFar @ g |

(iv) 1< 2005 T 38F a1 HATHET AT Gd FHATAT & Gag H Fael F1€ g€ A1q A1 T T
&0 I /g, JAT ATARTRAT ST FIET o for;

(v) 1 Fa¥=E 2007 AT 3HF FT8 AT T Jd FHATRAT & Hael § Fgel Gr= golr A1 °47 Tgr=q
0 I /g, AT ATARTRAT ST FIET o for;

(7) =% Frferret 3 frfir 48 &, Freforfirs Rfiemt #r SRmenfra fmm s, sfa-
‘48, 5t 71 7E A ZTFY T -

(1) =T FraqRi et JaT i qafy F e G i a7 =niEs FEaEr § 97 fweE 4T
FATALATET AT STALT(EF T AT SATAATST AT FISYO FH1F HT YT TET ST 8 JT TqH TR

T IT THHT 9T T ThaT g AT AT FC ThdT g, ATg LI &7 7 AT Ryt smafdr & forg, i
o 7 g2 Foret oft snfeie g1f o O 3T sfor Fr Yo F aEA A F AT T qAFATE |

i 1S oft 3w sreer ST A % OF 91 F qeme R S )

TR STgt e % Uewsier Ua AT A € AT sgha B A 8, Seme it gy sngha dee i
= Fafeasit & agd 37 =Eaw Som & F9 T8 e

uiq Tz oft o =y i arfaghy % vara, fanta e, afs s i 39 § = gu smy
#1 7 , =9 ARt & aefiw wrrarer qwstt SrEeh gur ey g ag s # € off ag s
TRTY & ST Tt ST T2 FHTH T SR 7T FHAT qaTH g

(2) ATE FHATL & FAT H Tgd gU [AANT FIAATEl ST Tl 6l T oY, T UH FEIT99 % 91 99 99 g5
et oft =reaT & amae § A At Frdersr s a8t B SR



[T [[-TTE 4] R T qSTAS : STEYRIT 5

T TH YT AL T T STAATHIAE FTHATRT, FHATL T TAT AT % T STAATHAF FIAATE!
EREIPIERIE R G GRS U

(3) STt |erH JITerhTey Yora & arfiar gria v aEel FT SMIer aqT § TGl agel qHTadr FHAT Hr
HATTAFIT T AT 7 TRt Tore U fagre & arferen it 22 o2 72 AT Senf |

8. 3= fafa=t = fafaaw 52 #:-

(7) 3u-Tafe=me (1) & o, Feferfea sataf=em Sfaeeriog T smem, aaiq -
“(1) Torett AT & Hag § Ser AT 34 71 AfHTw 46 F yraem 9] g €, A i 9o &
SATAT U Yord 39 g & 37 grY, e a¥ FwHE=rh aarHgw gar g1

(=) su-fafaa (3) & R raem= = errferer forar sras -

“qiq 27 9T 2010 T AT IHH IT8 S HHATL G9F ATSHAT H TS I aTer 7 aieame dor afgd
Yot 27 FEaT 2009 | AR Z0AT 1

9. I fataa = aiRfere || ¥, et fafRes gtaearfoa B s, serfa-

TR Il
(Rffrr 37 34)

A GO 9T AR Wgd HAfigd Tqam gt -

(1) sTeftereer =oft & S FH=ET, 01 S9ar 1986 &1 A7 384 T2, 97q 01 Faa¥ 1992 F IF HAT+=g
TU I, TAT ATIHILT A0 % ST FHATT 01 STt 1986 FT AT IHF TATT 93q 01 AT 1993 F &
HATET g0 &, & W §, A A1 @t 1960=100 ¥ =it wemel % forr sifee s
T STHITH o TAHTS & (ol dad § 600 3T & FUL, TATRATT 4 it AT Iz 92 T O
TAT T FTde 9% ageh T R | T8 T4 4 31 i 729 Ted # gig a1 Rivree $= fa

FATT FiEwfer it st
o Y9 AT ATH | g o o IR F § 0 F 9gmE Uga A K
wfawTg
(1) (2)
() | % 1250/-a% 0.67 wiaera
(i) | = 1251/- 7 %.2000/- &. 1250/~ &7 0.67 Sderd 9T + %. 1250/- | A&F q
Za #7 0.55 afaera
(i) | = 2001/- & %.2130/- &, 1250/- FT 0.67 Sidera a7 + %, 2000/- 37 . 1250/-
% = F Sia¥ FT 0.55 Tiaerd @ & 2000/- | ATe&F 9




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART III—SEC. 4]

(iv)

a0 Y9 AT ATIH | g T o IR F € F 9gmE Uga B K
RIRKLE
Torq T 0.33 TfaerT |
% 2130/- & srfersw % 1250/- T 0.67 Tiaerd a9 + ¥ 2000/- 3f¥ %. 1250/-

F o= & ¢ &7 0.55 qfaerd 91 + 5. 2130/- 37 =,
2000/- & &= % < &1 0.33 gfderd a7 + %, 2130/- °

e q o F7 0.17 Ffderd |

(2) TR ZO o ST FHAT 01 Faa< 1992 FT IT I8 TATT HATHIT gU & TAT AR 20T F ST
FHATT 01 AT 1993 FT AT IHF TATT HATHIA g0 &, % A H, g AT @1 1960=100
H et FRm F o sfrer St siea SusRT go EiE & [AATer ofaa § 1148 st &
FIL, TATEATT, TAF 4 i Hl Jlg T T GHIT AT T AT a9 TEAT 0T T | UH T4F 4
sihl it AETS Wed # i a1 Ferae $=r fa3r 3 srqeme afientera & sranft

qq Y9 A9 | G 999 F TR F €9 § AgITE Ugd fl |
BRI
(1) (2
() | 2400/-7% 0.35 gfaera

%, 2401/- ¥%.3850/-

%. 2400/- FT 0.35 widerd q=m + % 2400/- | srfersh g
ot T 0.29 Wirere |

%. 3851/- ¥%.4100/-

%.2400/- 1 0.35 FfaerqaeT + %.3850/- 3T &. 2400/- &%
A= % sfaT F1 0.29 fderd + = 3850 & sTFerT: o Gere F1
0.17 sfaera |

(iv)

%.4100/- & =fera

%. 2400/- FT 0.35 99 9T + &. 3850/- 7 %. 2400/- F
&= F a7 F7 0.29 Tfaera a9 + . 4100/- 3T %. 3850/-
% &= % SiA¥ F7 0.17 wierd T + =, 4100/- ¥ s7fe g

T9rT =T 0.09 Ffarerg |

(3) ST FHATET 1 30 1998 FT AT ITH THTT AT gU & Ive WIS 1I2d F@ar 1960=100 &
TR FTHIAT 6 o AT ATAT 3Eq STHATRT ToF ARIE 6 [qHTer d|a § 1616 F a(terh

THF 4 SFT AT, TATRATT, TAF Jlag & o0 T R TAT TedF RITae & o a9 a9 gril | vH
T 4 At it HETs e ¥ iy ar Miwrae {23 i aqere afeefera i seni-

o Y9 F  AqeEE | g Yo F wiiea F €7 § 7gE Ugd fir )
wfawTg
(1) (2)
() | % 3380/-a% 0.25 wtdera

(ii)

%. 3381/- & %.5420/-

%. 3380/- FT 0.25 iaerd qT + % 3380/- 7 AT&F T dorT
T 0.21 T |




[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 7

(i) | ®. 5421/- & ®.5770/- %. 3380/- T 0.35 WideraaT + %.5420/- i = 3380/- *
= % a1 0.21 WiA9d + 7. 5420 & Tfe g q9 F7
0.12 wfdera |

(iv) | =.5770/- % =feren %. 3380/- =T 0.25 widera 4T + & 5420/- ¥ % 3380/- *
A= % ofa¥ FT 0.21 IfA9T AT + %, 5770/ ¥ . 5420/-
= A1 siae 1 0.12 Tiderd q + %. 5770/- & Afe® g
F91T T 0.06 T |

T, 1 ®E 2005 X T H FHATRAT % da4 & ST 1 T4 1998 FT AT IHqF TATT AT 31 Tz

2002 F¥ AT I9H T2 HATHIT gU & Ira A TS Ued F@ar 1960=100 # =i e & o
AT AT SEd ITARH Tod gaFih & (dHTel siad | 1684 & ATIF WAF 4 i =,

ot weaw gfa & o 3 grft aur yoas Rieree & o ageht ang goeft | O& aei 4 st it
HETE Ted | i 71 Ferae = fa 77 srqam afiawtera i sraefi-

qq Y9 A9 | G 999 F TR F €9 § AgTE Ugd fl |
BIGRILE

(1) (2)

(i) |=. 3550/ TF 0.24 wfdera

(i) | % 3551/- 7 %. 5660/- %. 3550/~ FT 0.24 wiaerd qam + % 3550/- | 3(ferd g
YT T 0.20 TTord |

(i) | ®. 5651/- 7 %.6010/- %. 3550/- &1 0.24 Iiaerqa™T + %.5650/- i<

&. 3550/- % &1 % &q¥ &7 0.20 Ifaerd + €. 5650 & &
A G FT 0.12 Tfaerd |

(iv) | ®.6010/- & 1far %. 3550/- T 0.24 TIIerd 9T + €. 5650/- 3f¥ ¥. 3550/-
#= F T F7 0.20 FiFerd T + %, 6010/- 7T . 5650/-
= = % i< &1 0.12 FTAT TAT + % 6010/- H AT ToT
ot =7 0.06 STerd |

(4) 1 9 2005 9% AT IF TATT HATAGT FHATRAT F Hagl H,HGITS Tgd Fg@ar 1960=100 & sr=ifs
FIRMT & ford orfere et 3 a STSIHT §oF a1 & [duTel ofed § 2288 & sTfaF Jeie 4 il #i,

Tomtearfa, weas gia = oy 37 grft ao wos ferae & o et i gRft | STseT o 4 st & fordr
HEITE T2d | UHT Iz AT Frae ot Gerd it 0.18 Siaerd sl 2 & Tawferd @l STra:-

g 1 W< 2005 9T AT F, FHATRAT F Hae § ST 01 Fawa< 2002 FHT T IHF a1 At 30 39 2005 F1 a7
IEH Tg HATHET g0 &, TevTs Ted 36 G it 91dT h JqET o7 g

U< 1 TFET 2007 FT AT IHF TATT AATHGT FHATAT o Haler §F TEITE T2 S@ar 1960=100 # =i
FIRMT o o e Tt 3 a STSIHT §oF a1 & [duTel ofed § 2836 7 STfaF Jeie 4 3ihi #i,



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

TATREAT, Yo Fag o o0 3 GHIT AT 4T Nrde & o FEet AT gRIT | STHHT T4F 4 3l & o
AEITE Ted # Ut gig a1 frae g dem & 0,15 wiaera #it 2 & aiiwtera i Sraefi:-

(5)  HETE AT g a9 % HAFga, T AT [GEFT F HelAl § THIAT GARERI 6 (qHTR! sHad a¢
TEAT FEALN & AEA 3T 31 JATS I THTH g ATAT GG 6 (77 37T IHT a9 T, TS ST I % Al |
TERTTTT FAHThT o6 [AHTET SHET T¥ 3 01 R F AW ¥ 31 AL T THTH g aTAl FHTR! & ford &
T |

(6)  UIETE Yerd, ST9TRAT YO T ATHFAT 9T o el § HeiTe Ugd HUL Srediad a4 & AqHIT aF
g |

(7) T g Ferd I¥ WEATE TF9r T STmia werefieheor F ara ot & Srnef |

(8) T YTed Afafeh Gem e 3w At & |

9) o FoaArtt it g7 om =gAaw Gerd § FH g Uiq g 99 TAT ATARTH T HT AN FATH q90T
H s1fere 8, g ~gHaH G I AR HEWTS TEd g HY T |

10. SO fAteIAl ® 9 ||| & o Feterfaa oo wiaenfug e sro, sera-
“qfRfre I
(Rffzw 39 W)

TIETE Gerd it AT < TH TH1L g -
(F)  FHATT % AT H,StorTiors FHATRT 1 BEHe, Tt FHART FEE A0 # o7 7 01
TaTT 1992 % TF HATHIT gl AT AT STl HHATLN ATIFRET a1 § AT 3T 01 AT 1993 & I3
AT g oT:-

AT IFAATE #1ie afRar daw f afar
(1) (2)

&. 1500/- T T w1 30 TAeW o TRET T qoT (+) 9t w1 30 wierd,
St ot wfeer [t § sterae oy i STt 8 wig wEas a9
= o =i, ettty Ta 9o grft | g a7 Afd i TearT g
T IR %, 375/- ITAHTE & 7 A1 20T |

%. 1501 §%.3000 Faw w1 20 wiaed g wfEw e qur (+) 9l #7120 iAo,
St ot wfeer [t § storae oy i STt 8 aig wEas a9
= o =i, ettty Ta 99 grit | g9 a7 Afd i TiearT 9o
T IR %, 450/- ITAHTE & 7 q81 20T |

%.3000 ¥ rfer AT T 15 TAH o TRAT GoF TAT (+) A9 #1715 A9,
St ot wfeer [ty § storame & oy i STt 8 aig wEaTe a9




[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 9

AT IFAATE wTie afRar daw f afar

(1 (2)
F o 7=, srfafs A Sam grft | q=1 qur sfafs afam Sam
T AN €. 600/- TAHTE & 7 qAT &. 1250/- TAHTE & ATIF ot
g |

(@) FHATAT o THA H, STARToTE FHATAT FT BISHL, TGF FHATL FTAIE AT T 2T 3 01
TATIT 1992 F AT ITF THTT AATAFT AT AT AT SgF FHATRT ATFFTEY a7 # o7 & 01 S[errs
1993 T AT I THTT HATIIT gall AT :-

AT IFAATE wTfe afRar daw f afar

(1) (2)
%.2870 % Faw 1 30 wiaed g wfa e qur (+) 9=t #7130 e,
et ST s ffY & siorem % oy it st 2 o wEe W
= o 7=, ettty Ta 9o grft | g 97 Afd i TearT 9o
FT AR %, 720/- TTAATE | FH 51 2T |
%.2871 9 %.5740 A w1 20 wided g wfE e qur (+) 99t #7120 yider,
et ST s ffY & siorem % oy it st 2 o wEe W
= o =i, ettty Ta 9o grit | g 97 Afd i aearT e
T TR %, 860/- TTAHTE & FH AT 2T |
%.5740 ¥ wiferw AT T 15 TAH o TRAT GoF TAT (+) A0 #1715 A9,
et ST sy ffY & siorer % oy it st 2 oeg wEe W
F forxr 7=, srfafs wfam Sam grft | g=1 qur sfafs afam S
T ANT €. 1150/- TTAHTE & FH qAT €. 2400/- AT T AT T81
BT |

(M 01 9= 1998 T AT IAF TATT HATHIT 2l AT HAFIOrH FHATAT T BISHL FHAATAL
(AT ToT FE FT) 6 ATAA | -

AT IFAATE #Tfe afRar dow f afar

(1) (2)
%.4040 9% Fa w1 30 WA o TRAT GoF AT (+) |9 #1730 A9,
St ot wfeer [t § storae & oy i STt g oig wEaTs a9
F forxr 7=, srfafs ufam Sam grft | g=1 qur sfafes afam Sa

T IRT %, 1015/- ITAHTE & FH q1 AT |

%.4041 9 %. 8080 A w1 20 wiaed g wfRaw e quT (+) 99l #7120 g,
St sToreT wiesy S & sterame & oy &t STt & wig wews 9=
F forxr 731, srfafs ufam Sam grft | g=1 T sfafes afam Sa

FT AR %, 1212/- AATE & FH T8l 2T |




10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

AGHT IIAHTE w1 yRar de= i afyr

(1) (2)
%.8080 ¥ rferF AT T 15 TAH o TRAT Yo TAT (+) |91 1 15 I,
St ot wfesr [t § st oy i STt 8 aig wEaTs 9w
= o =i, ettty Ta 9o grft | g 97 Afd i aiearT 9o
T ART €, 1616/- T(AATE & F9 97 % 3378/- WAATE A 1fer Agi
BT |

Tiq, 01 5 2005 &, sereTiors FHATRAT Tl Gresh, FHATRAT (TAFTET TAT FTHIA A1) F JTH HAT 01
I 1998 T AT IHF TAT 93q 31 erFgay 2002 FT T IqH 4 HATHFT g0 o, TE dere it qremeor
T TH THI ZA -

AT IFAATE wTfe aRar daw f afar

(1) (2)
%4210 9% FaT F 30 WA I TRAT Ged AT (+) Al w1 30 Fiaera,
St ot wfeer [t § storae oy i STt 8 aig wEaTe 9w
= o 7=, ettty Ta 9o grft | g9 97 Afd i aearT 9o
FT AN %. 1056/- ATH TTaHTE R |
%.4211 9 %.8420 FIT w20 TAeH g1 gRE™ das qAT (+) Al w20 widerd,
St ot wfeer [t § st oy i STt g aig wEaTe a9
= o 7=, ettty Ta 9o grft | g9 97 Afd i aearT 9o
FT AN %. 1262/- ATH TTAHTE SR |
%. 84207 rferF AT F 15 WA I TRATT GeF AT (+) A0 F 15 AT,
St ot wfeer [t § stora oy i STt g aig wEaTe a9
F forxr 7=, srfafs ufam Sam grft | g=1 T sfafs afam Sam
T AN & 1687/- AR T(AATE T9T ATTFHaA & 3521/- AqwTE
BT |

() 01 A 2005 T IT IHh THTT AATHGT B AT FTRTIoIE FHATAT Fl FIEHY FHATAT
(AT T FE TT) F e 7o

AqHT NiAHTg TR aRaR dem it afr
(1) (2)

%.5720 9% FaT F 30 WA I TRAT GeT AT (+) Al w1 30 FiAra,
St ot wfeer [t § storae oy i STt 8 wig wEaTs a9
= o =i, ettty Ta 99 grft | g7 97 Afd i TearT 9o
FT AR %, 1435/- AT TTaHTE R |

%.57219 %.11440 AT w20 wided o qRare dord a7 (+) 9=l w1 20 iderd,
St ot wfeer [ty § storame & oy i STt 8 wig wEaTe a9




[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 11

F o 7=, srfafs ufam Saw grft | g=1 qur sfafs afam Sae

FHT AR %, 1715/- =TT TAHTE R |

%.11440 srferw FaT A 15 IA9H g TRER T9q9 qAT (+) |0 F1 15 wiaerd,
et ST s ffY & siorer % oy it st 2 o wEe W
F forxr 7=, srfafs ufam Saw grft | g=1 qur sfafs afam Sam
FT AR & 2292/- =[FaR TiAwTg T2 AfdFaw = 4784/ afawrg
g |

T, 01 W 2005 &, SfershTiers FHATVAT T GIEh, FHATAT (ATAFHTLT TAT FHTHIAT ZA1T) F TTHA
HST 01 Fawa¥ 2002 FT 3T 36 TETd 99g 30 1% 2005 FT AT I9H IF FA7+gT gu ¥, ahaw
o Y AT §Y 39 GT F AqHTE (9H ghMT -

() 01 WE 2007 T AT IH+F TATT HATAIT B AT SRR FHATRAT FIGISHL FHATAT
(AT T FE FT) F e 7o

AqHT WiAHTg TR aRa derm it afer

(1) (2)
%.7090 T FaT F 30 WA I TRAT Ged AT (+) Al w1 30 Fiaera,
St ot wfesr [t § storae & oy i STt 8 wig wEaTe a9
= o 7=, ettty Ta 99 grft | g 997 Afd i Tear 9o
FT AR %, 1779/- AT TAHTE R |
%.7091 & %.14180 FAT A 20 T JF TRAT G949 qAT (+) A0 F1 20 Fiaerd,
St ot wfeer [t § stora oy i STt g aig wEaTe a9
= o =i, ettty Ta 99 grit | g 97 Afd i TearT 9o
FT AR %, 2186/- ~IATH TTAHTE R |
%.14180 ¥ s1fars AT w15 wided gor qRar dord a7 (+) 9=t w1 15 gidera,
St ot wfeer [t § storae oy i STt 8 aig wEaTs a9
F forxr 7=, srfafs wfam Saw grft | g=1 T sfafs afam Sae
T AN & 2841/- AR T(AATE T9T ATTFHIaA & 5930/- ATqwTE
BT |

feoouf -

(1) ==rE war srfafes afem Sae 97 37 T8 g |

(2)  SUEH AgET 9RET derd it AT F yAeE | aaaa, R 2 % s g (ve) § [yiha eaw
ot fafaaw 35 & gu-fafaaw (3) i sarear & [Matta vt 1 79 g

(3)  SferTiorsh HHATLT * HTA §, TRare Hord it =qaaq a7 srferawram «rfer, FH=r g sgha aa

#¥ T F AT H GO |



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(4) =T g IRA U9 TAT ATTTE G FT HA TN AATH ST & HF graTl g af GOTHRT Bl FAaq
HorT &F ST SfiY UHT ~gAqH qETT G99 9% 7S Tgd T A haT ST | i, =gaaw aiame 9o %
srfafys afare e wat ot STt |
TSI ATIT
EATHT T | 3T U 3 AT S el e Siod qgud MIEt T odi & A qH, qatad
Rt gTeT T T f3erT Srferaer 3 SMmen U¥ e S sht ST | ATLATT S | 3¢ St o 9t ¥q¥ 3 FHTET
THTAAT ATIFHTLN FHT % A9 geareAid ¢ | THI, TH TG % TAATIT T79 7 et 21w & {ai 92 o
TAT gl T
TH. T. FEAM, ST AGIASES, AT GAT187 &=
[FA=TToe-111/4 /3 TeTToT/462/17]

e ; gt fafaee =i faei 29.09.1995 =¥ ATEa = TSI (STETeTen) H stfef=ra foram = o oiiw §F s agrTg
(FH=TE) der fafaamaety, 1995 # a1a 3 Herrerm = faw 70 =217 3 srEme Tore § et fo o o

EIERLED STE=AT . e
At 22 (4) T | TS /ATTH3T/4464/2000 22.07.2000
faffaw 2,3,12,18,27,32, 33, | wua1/wadi/aruasne/1539/2003 03.04.2003
34,35,36,39,40,41,48

=W 2(0),8,9,10 TUF 1 /TaET/ATHA/8926/2010 31.05.2010

BANK OF MAHARASHTRA
(HEAD OFFICE : PUNE)
NOTIFICATION

Pune, the 3rd March, 2018
(Amendment to the Bank of Maharashtra (Employees’) Pension Regulations, 1995)

F.No.:AX1/ST/Pension Reg./1524/2017-18.—In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (f) of sub-section
(2) of Section 19 of the Banking Companies (Acquisition and Transfer of Undertakings) Act, 1970 ( 5 of
1970), the Board of Directors of the Bank of Maharashtra in consultation with the Reserve Bank of India
and with the previous sanction of the Central Government, hereby makes the following regulations further to
amend the Bank of Maharashtra(Employees’) Pension Regulations, 1995, namely :-

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Bank of Maharashtra(Employees’) Pension(Amendment)
Regulations, 2016.

(2) Save as otherwise expressly provided in these regulations, they shall come into force on the date of
their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Bank of Maharashtra(Employees’) Pension Regulations 1995 (hereinafter referred to as the said
regulations), -

In regulation 2, in clause (s), after sub-clause(c), the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(d) in relation to an employee who retired or died while in service on or after the first day of May,
2005 the basic pay including stagnation increments, if any, and Special pay, Graduation Pay,
Professional Qualification Pay, increment component of Fixed Personnel Pay and Officiating
Pay, if any, drawn by the employee during the last ten months of his service in the Bank:



[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 13

Provided that with effect from 1" day of May, 2005 the provisions of this clause shall have
effect in relation to an employee who retired or died while in service on or after 1% day of
April, 1998 but before 30" day of April, 2005.”.

3. In regulation 3 of the said regulations, for sub-regulation (4), the following sub-regulation shall be
substituted, namely:-

““(4) (a) join the service of the bank on or after the notified date and on or before the 31* day of March,
2010;”.

(b) after sub-regulation (10), the following sub-regulations shall be inserted, namely:-

“(11) were in the service of the Bank prior to the 29" September, 1995 and continue in the service of
the Bank as on the 27" April, 2010 provided such employee meets the requirement and comply with the
conditions laid down in the settlement;

(12)  were in the service of the Bank prior to the 29" September, 1995 and retired after that date
andprior to 27" April, 2010 provided such employee meets the requirements and comply with the
conditions laid down in the settlement;

(13)  wherein service of the Bank, prior to the 29" September, 1995 retired after that date and had
died in which case their family shall be entitled to the pension or the family pension, as the case may be
under these regulations, if the family of the deceased meets the requirement and complies with the
conditions laid down in the settlement;

(14)  were in the service of the bank prior to the 29" September, 1995 and died while in service of the
Bank after that date in which case their family shall be entitled to the pension or the family pension, as
the case may be under these regulations, if the family of the deceased meet the requirement and
complies with the conditions laid down in the settlement.”.

4, In regulation 28 of the said regulations, after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Provided further that employees who ceased to be in service on or after the 29" September, 1995 on
account of voluntary retirement before attaining the age of superannuation but after rendering service
for a minimum period of 15 years in accordance with the Scheme framed in this regard by the Board
with the approval of the Government, shall be entitled to join the Pension Fund, subject to the
compliance of the terms and conditions mentioned in the Scheme.”.

5. In regulation 36 of the said regulations,-
(a) in clause (c), the following provisoshall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that on and from the 1* day of May, 2005 the amount of minimum pension, in respect of an
employee, other than a part-time employee, who retired on or after the 1* April, 1998 but before the 31*
October, 2002 shall be rupees one thousand and sixty per month and rupees three hundred and fifty
five in respect of a part-time employee drawing 1/3 scale wages, rupees five hundred and thirty in
respect of a part-time employee drawing %2 scale wages and rupees seven hundred and ninety five in
respect of a part-time employee drawing % scale wages, where the part-time employee retired on or
after 1* day of April, 1998.”;

(b) after clause (c), the following clause (d) shall be insertednamely:-

(d) rupees one thousand four hundred and thirty five per month in respect of an employee, other than a
part-time employee, where the employee retired on or after 1" day of May 2005 and rupees four
hundred and eighty per month in respect of a part-time employee drawing 1/3 scale of wages, rupees
seven hundred and twenty per month in respect of part-time employee drawing Y2 scale wages and
rupees one thousand and eighty per month in respect of a part-time employee drawing 3 scale wages,
where the part-time employee retired on or after the 1* day of May 2005:



14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

()

)

Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005 the provisions of this clause shall also apply to an
employee including a part-time employee who retired on or after 1* November 2002 but on or before
30™ April 2005.;

(e) rupees one thousand seven hundred and seventy nine per month in respect of an employee, other
than a part-time employee, where the employee retired on or after 1% day of November 2007 and
rupees five hundred and ninety five per month in respect of a part-time employee drawing 1/3 scale of
wages, rupees eight hundred and ninety two per month in respect of part-time employee drawing Y2
scale of wages and rupees one thousand three hundred and thirty nine per month in respect of a part-
time employee drawing % scale wages, where the part-time employee retired on or after the 1% day of
November 2007.”.

In regulation 40, of the said regulations, in sub-regulation (4),-

(1) in clause (a), after sub-clause (iii),the following proviso and clause shall be inserted, namely:-

‘Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005 the provisions of this sub-clause shall have effect as
if for the words “six thousand seven hundred and fifty six”, the words “seven thousand and forty”, had
been substituted.;

(iv) nine thousand five hundred and sixty five rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1* day of May 2005; ’;

(v) Eleven thousand eight hundred and fifty six rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of November 2007.”

(ii) in clause (b), after sub-clause (iii), the following proviso and clause shall be inserted, namely:-

‘Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005 the provisions of this sub-clause shall have effect as
if for the words “six thousand seven hundred and fifty six”, the words “seven thousand and forty”, had
been substituted;

(iv) nine thousand five hundred and sixty five rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of May 2005.’;

(v) Eleven thousand eight hundred and fifty six rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of November 2007.

(iii) in clause (c), after sub-clause (iii), the following proviso and clause shall be inserted, namely:-

‘Provided that on and from the 1st day of May 2005 the provisions of this sub-clause shall have effect
as if for the words “three thousand three hundred and seventy eight,” the words “three thousand five
hundred and twenty,” had been substituted.;

(iv) four thousand seven hundred and eighty three rupees per mensem only in respect of employees,
both officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1* day of May 2005.".

(v) five thousand nine hundred and twenty eight rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of November 2007.

For regulation 48 of the said regulations, the following regulations shall be substituted, namely:-

“48. Recovery of pecuniary loss caused to Bank.-

(1) The Competent Authority may withhold or withdraw a pension or a part thereof, whether
permanently or for a specified period, and order recovery from pension of the whole or part of any
pecuniary loss caused to the Bank if in any departmental or judicial proceedings the pensioner is found
guilty of grave misconduct or negligence or criminal breach of trust or forgery or for acts done
fraudulently during the period of his service:



[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 15

9.

Provided that the Board shall be consulted before any final orders are passed:

Provided further that where a part of pension is withheld or withdrawn the amount of pension drawn by
a pensioner shall not be less than the minimum pension payable under these regulations:

Provided also that the departmental proceedings, if instituted while the employee was in service, shall,
after the retirement of the employee, be deemed to be proceedings under these regulations and shall be
continued and concluded by the authority by which they were commenced in the same manner as if the
employee had continued in service.

2) No departmental proceedings, if not instituted while the employee was in service, shall be
instituted in respect of an event which took place more than four years before such institutions:

Provided that the disciplinary proceedings so instituted shall be in accordance with the procedure
applicable to disciplinary proceedings in relation to the employee during the period of his service.

A3 Where the Competent Authority orders recovery of pecuniary loss from the pension, the
recovery shall not ordinarily be made at a rate exceeding one-third of the pension admissible on the
date of retirement of the employee.”.

In regulation 52 of the said regulations,-
(a) for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Except in the case of an employee to whom the provisions of regulation 34 or regulation 46 apply,
a pension other than family pension shall become payable from the date following the date on which an
employee retires”.

(b) in sub-regulation (3), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that pension including family pension to those who opted to join the Bank Employees’
Pension Scheme on or after the 27" April, 2010 shall be payable with effect from the 27" November,
2009.”.

For Appendix II to the said regulations, the following Appendix shall be substituted, namely:-
“Appendix II
(See regulation 37)

Dearness relief on basic pension shall be as under :-

1

In the case of employees who were in the workmen cadre and who retired on or after the 1* day of

January, 1986, but before the ™ day of November, 1992; and in the case of employees who were in the
officers’ cadre and who retired on or after the 1% day of January, 1986, but before the 1 day of July, 1993,
dearness relief shall be payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4
points over 600 points in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial
Workers in the series 1960 = 100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said four points shall
be calculated in the manner given below:-

Scale of basic pension | The rate of dearness relief as a percentage of basic pension
per month

(i) | UptoRs.1250 0.67 per cent

(i) | Rs.1251 to Rs.2000 0.67 per cent ofRs.1250 plus 0.55 per cent of basic pension in excess of
Rs.1250.

(iii) | Rs.2001 to Rs.2130 0.67 per cent 0fRs.1250 plus 0.55 per cent of the difference between

Rs.2000 and Rs.1250 plus 0.33 per cent of basic pension in excess of
Rs.2000.




16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(iv) | Above Rs.2130 0.67 percent of Rs.1250 plus 0.55 percent the difference between Rs.2000
and Rs.1250 plus 0.33 per cent of the difference between Rs.2130 and
Rs.2000 plus 0.17 per cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.2130.

2) In the case of employees who are in workmen cadre and who retire on or after the 1% day of
November, 1992; and in the case of employees who are in the officers’ cadre and who retire on or after the ™
day of July, 1993, dearness relief shall be payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case
may be, of every 4 points over 1148 points in the quarterly average of All India Average Consumer Price
Index for Industrial Workers in the series 1960 = 100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every
said four points shall be calculated in the manner given below :-

Scale of basic pension | The rate of dearness relief as a percentage of basic pension
per month
(i) | Up to Rs.2400 0.35 per cent
(i) | Rs.2401 to Rs.3850 0.35 percent of Rs. 2400 plus 0.29 percent of basic pension in excess of
Rs.2400
(ii1) | Rs.3851 to Rs.4100 0.35 percent of Rs.2400 plus 0.29 percent of the difference between
Rs.3850 and  Rs.2400 plus 0.17 percent of basic pension in excess of
Rs.3850
(iv) | above Rs.4100 0.35 per cent of Rs.2400 plus 0.29 per cent of the difference between
Rs.3850 and Rs.2400 plus 0.17 per cent of the difference between Rs.4100
and Rs.3850 plus 0.09 per cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.4100

A3) In the case of employees who retire on or after the 1* day of April, 1998, dearness relief shall be
payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 1616 points
in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers in the series
1960=100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said four points shall be calculated in the
manner given below :-

Scale of basic | The rate of dearness relief as a percentage of basic pension
pension per month

(i) | Upto Rs.3380 0.25 per cent

(i) | Rs.3381 to Rs.5420 | 0.25 per cent of Rs.3380 plus 0.21 percent basic pension in excess of Rs.3380

(ii1) | Rs.5421 to Rs.5770 | 0.25 per cent of Rs.3380 plus 0.21 percent of the difference between Rs.5420
and Rs.3380 plus 0.12 per cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.5420.

(iv) | Above Rs.5770 0.25 per cent of Rs.3380 plus 0.21 percent of the difference between Rs.5420
and Rs.3380 plus 0.12 per cent of the difference between Rs.5770 andRs.5420
plus 0.06 per cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.5770.

Provided that on or from the 1" day of May 2005 in the case of employees who retire on or after the 1* day of
April 1998 but on or before the 31* October 2002, dearness relief shall be payable for every rise or be
recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 1684 points in the quarterly average of
the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers in the series 1960=100. Such increase or
decrease in dearness relief for every said 4 points shall be calculated in the manner given below:

Scale of basic pension The rate of dearness relief as a percentage of basic pension
per month
(i) | UptoRs.3550 0.24 per cent
(i) | Rs.3551 to Rs.5650 0.24 per cent of Rs.3550 plus 0.20 per cent basic pension in excess of
Rs.3550
(ii1) | Rs.5651 to Rs.6010 0.24 per cent of Rs.3550 plus 0.20 per cent of the difference between
Rs.5650 andRs.3550 plus 0.12 of basic pension in excess of Rs.5650
(iv) | Above Rs.6010 0.24 per cent of Rs.3550 plus 0.20 per cent of the difference between
Rs.5650 andRs.3550 plus 0.12 per cent of the difference between Rs.6010
and Rs.5650 plus 0.06 per cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.6010




[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 17

4) In respect of employees who retire on or after the 1% day of May, 2005, dearness relief shall be
payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 2288 points
in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers in the series
1960=100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said 4 points shall be calculated at the rate of
0.18 per cent of basic pension:

Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005, in respect of employees who retired on or after 1* day of
November 2002 but on or before 30™ day of April 2005, dearness relief shall be payable in terms of this
clause:

Provided further that in respect of employees who retired on or after the 1* day of November 2007, Dearness
Relief shall be payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points
over 2836 points in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial
Workers in the series 1960=100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said 4 points shall be
calculated at the rate of 0.15 per cent of basic pension.

5 Dearness relief shall be payable for the half year commencing from the 1¥day of February and ending
with the 31* day of July on the quarterly average of the index figures published for the months of October,
November and December of the previous year and for the half year commencing from the 1* day of August
and ending with the 31" day of January on the quarterly average of the index figures published for the months
of April, May and June of the same year.

6) In the case of family pension, invalid pension and compassionate allowance, dearness relief shall be
payable in accordance with the rates mentioned above.

(@)) Dearness relief will be allowed on full basic pension even after commutation.

3 Dearness relief is not payable on additional pension.

9 Pensioner whose basic pension is less than minimum pension but the aggregate of basic pension and
additional pension is more than the minimum pension shall draw dearness relief as applicable to minimum
pension.”.

10. For Appendix III to the said regulations, the following Appendix shall be substituted, namely :-

“Appendix III
(See Regulation 39)

The ordinary rates of family pension shall be as under:-
(a) In respect of employees other than part-time employees, where the employee was in the workmen

cadre and retired before the 1* day of November, 1992 or where the employee was in the officers’ cadre and
retired before the 1% day of July, 1993:-

Scale of pay per | Amount of monthly Family Pension
month

(1) Up to Rs. 1500 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per cent of
allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.375 per month.

(i) | Rs.1501 to 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20 percent of
Rs.3000 allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic
and additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.450 per month.




18

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(iii)

Above Rs.3000

15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per cent of
allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.600 per month and
not more than Rs.1250 per month.

(b)

In respect of employees other than part-time employees, where the employee was in the workmen
cadre and retired on or after the 1* day of November, 1992 or where the employee was in the officers’ cadre
and retired on or after the 1* day of July 1993:-

Scale of pay per | Amount of monthly Family Pension
month

(1) Up to Rs.2870 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per cent of
allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.720 per
month.

(i) | Rs.2871 to 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20 per cent of

Rs.5740 allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.860 per
month.

(iii) | Above Rs.5740 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per cent of
allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance shall be theadditional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1150 per
month and a maximum of Rs.2400 per month.

(c) In respect of employees (both officers and workmen) other than part-time employees retiring on or

after the 1% day of April, 1998: -

Scale of pay Amount of monthly Family Pension

per month

(1) Up to Rs.4040 | 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per cent of

allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for
dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic
and additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.1015 per month.

(i) | Rs.4041 to 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20 per cent of

Rs.8080 allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for

dearness allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic
and additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.1212 per month.

(iii) | Above 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per cent of allowances

Rs.8080 which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.1616 per month and a maximum
0fRs.3378 per month:

Provided that on and from the 1" day of May, 2005 in respect of the employees (both officers and workmen),
other than part time employees, who retired on or after the 1* day of April 1998 but on or before the 31%day of
October, 2002, the ordinary rate of family pension shall be as under:-

Scale of pay | Amount of monthly Family Pension
per month

(1) Up to | 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per cent of allowances
Rs.4210 which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness




[9FT [I-ETs 4] AR <hl TSI ¢ THIYNT 19

allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1056 p.m.

(i) | Rs.4211 to | 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20 per cent of allowances
Rs.8420 which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1262 p.m.

(i) | Above 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per cent of allowances
Rs.8420 which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family  pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1687 p.m. and a
maximum of Rs.3521 p.m.

(d) In respect of employees (both officers and workmen) other than part-time employees retiring on or
after the 1st day of the May 2005:-

Scale of pay per | Amount of monthly Family Pension
month

(1) Upto Rs.5720 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per cent of
allowance which are counted for making contribution to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1435 p.m.

(i) | Rs.5721to 20 per cent of the Pay shall be basic family pension plus 20 per cent of allowance
Rs.11440 which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall be subject to minimum of Rs.1715 p.m.

(iii) | Above Rs.11440 | 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per cent of
allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for the dearness allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate
of basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.2292
p-m. and maximum of Rs.4784 p.m.:

Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005, in respect of employees who retired on or after the 1* day
of November 2002 but on or before the 30™ April 2003, ordinary rates of family pension shall be in terms of
this clause.

e) In respect of employees (both officers and workmen) other than part-time employees retiring on or
after the 1* day of November 2007:-

Scale of pay per | Amount of monthly Family Pension
month

(1) Up to Rs.7090 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per cent of
allowance which are counted for making contribution to Provident Fund but not
for dearness allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of
basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1779 p.m.

(i) | Rs.7091 to 20 per cent of the Pay shall be basic family pension plus 20 per cent of allowance
Rs.14180 which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall be subject to minimum of Rs.2186 p.m.

(iii) | Above Rs.14180 | 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per cent of
allowances which are counted for making contributions to Provident Fund but not
for the dearness allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate
of basic and additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.2841
p-m. and maximum of Rs.5930 p.m.




20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

Notes :-
(1) Dearness relief is not payable on additional family pension.
(2) Scale of pay for the purpose of calculation of family pension as above shall be the aggregate of Pay as

defined in clause (s) of regulation 2 and allowances as defined in the Explanation to sub-regulation (3) of
regulation 35.

3) In the case of a part-time employee, the minimum amount of family pension and maximum amount of
family pension shall be in proportion to the rate of scale wages drawn by the employee.

4) In case the aggregate of basic family pension and additional family pension falls short of minimum
pension the pensioner may be given minimum family pension and dearness relief may be paid on such
minimum family pension. However, no additional family pension shall be payable over and above the
minimum family pension.”.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

The Regulations which have been given retrospective effect are as per the agreed terms and conditions of the
settlements and Joint Notes signed between the Indian Banks’ Association on behalf of member banks on the
basis of specific mandate given by the respective banks in this regard and apex level workmen unions and
officers’ associations of the Banks. Therefore, interests of no person shall be adversely affected by such
retrospective effect.

M.A. KARAJAGI, Dy. General Manager, H.R.M.

[Advt.-1TI/4/Exty./462/17]

Foot Note:
The Principal Regulations were notified in the Gazette of India (Extraordinary) on 29.09.1995 and subsequent
amendment(s) to the Bank of Maharashtra (Employees’) Pension Regulations 1995 were published in the
Gazette as per details below :

Reg.No. Notification No. Date
Regulations 22(4) AX-1/ST/OSR/4464/2000 22.07.2000
Regulations 2, 3, 12, 18, 27, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, | AX-1/ST/OSR/1539/2003 03.04.2003
39,40, 41, 48

Regulations 2 (0), 8, 9, 10 AX-1/St/OSR/8926/2010 31.05.2010

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.
ALOK Digitally signed
by ALOK KUMAR

Date: 2018.03.21
KUMAR 63636 o550



		2018-03-21T16:38:38+0530
	ALOK KUMAR




